Group P - Street Marking Signs
Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan
.|U- channel posts (Galvanized)

U-Channel 50, 12 ft. 3 Wt. per foot Units per bundle 50 50

Weight per bundle 1980 1926

Price per bundle $2,666.90 $2,244.50

Caps for U-Channel post for extruded street name blanks Each $5.70 $4.85
(die cast aluminum) 5 %47, #914X-0190 or equal Item # RPB91VXOL90

U-Channel cap 180° 12” for extruded blades w/set screws Each $12.50 $13.12
Item# | RPB412VXNV180

U-Channel cap 90° 12” for extruded blades w/set screws Each $12.50 $13.12
Item # RPB412VX0L90

90° crosspiece 12” w/set screws Each $12.50 $13.28
Item # RPB412CX

Crosses for extruded street name blanks Each $6.05 $5.17
(die cast aluminum) 5 %47, #X990X Item # RPB990X

. |Aluminum sign blanks .080 Gage

30" Octagon Each $28.07 $20.92
Item # .080

36" Octagon Each $40.45 $29.86
Item # .080

12x8 Each $7.37 $2.50
Item # .080

12x 18 Each $7.46 $5.31
Item # .080

18" Square Each $10.67 $7.96
Item # .080

24" Squ or Dia Each $18.45 $13.89
Item # .080

36" Triangle Each $21.96 $15.74
Item # .080

36" Squ or Dia Each $41.37 $32.46
Item # .080

48" Squ or Dia Each $74.23 $56.00
Item # .080
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan

10 |24" Pentagon Each $28.07 $13.78
Item # .080

11 |36" Pentagon Each $40.45 $29.82
Item # .080

12]6 x 24 Each $13.61 $4.27
Item # .080

13]8 x24 Each $23.09 $5.42
Item # .080

14|10 x 24 Each $12.51 $6.57
Item # .080

15]12x6 Each $3.19 $2.09
Item # .080

1648 x 18 Each $27.53 $21.54
Item # .080

1748 x 24 Each $36.79 $28.43
Item # .080

18]48 x 30 Each $45.77 $35.32
Item # .080

19|36 x 36 Each $41.37 $32.46
Item # .080

20 |30" Squ or Dia Each $28.71 $22.45
Item # .080

21|18 x24/24x 18 Each $14.11 $10.42
Item # .080

22124 x 12 Each $10.03 $6.95
Item # .080

23|24 x 30/30 x 24 Each $23.24 $17.96
Item # .080

2424 x 36 Each $27.53 $21.93
Item # 0.08

25130 x 36 Each $34.73 $27.19
Item # .080

26|36 x 12 Each $13.86 $10.61
Item # .080

27 130" circle blanks Each $28.41 $21.22
Item # .080
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan
28136 circle blanks Each $41.00 $29.66
Item # .080
C.|Overhead Street Names
29120 x 48 Each $38.38 $23.84
Item#
3020 x 52 Each $41.12 $29.16
Item#
31|20 x 60 Each $46.60 $33.43
Item#
32120x 72 Each No Bid $39.84
Item#
D. |Extruded blanks - double sided
1 ]6x20 Each $14.90 $7.89
Item #
2 l6x24 Each $14.90 $9.47
Item #
3 |6x30 Each $18.63 $11.97
Item #
4 |6x36 Each $22.91 $13.63
Item #
5 |9x20 Each $21.63 $10.42
Item #
6 |ox24 Each $21.63 $12.50
Item #
7 9x30 Each $27.02 $15.79
Item #
8 |9x36 Each $32.44 $18.10
Item #
9 |9x42 Each $37.83 $21.33
Item #
E. |Traffic Faces
Sizes Quantities
1 |6x24 1-9 No bid $1.88
10-24 No bid $1.88
25-40 $7.61 $1.88
50+ $7.61 $1.88
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan

2 |12x8 1-9 No Bid $1.24
10-24 No Bid $1.24

25-40 No Bid $1.24

50+ No Bid $1.24

3 |12x18 1-9 No Bid $2.82
10-24 $7.66 $2.82

25-40 $5.02 $2.82

50+ $5.02 $2.82

4 |12x36 1-9 No Bid $5.64
10-24 $11.38 $5.64

25-40 $8.52 $5.64

50+ $8.52 $5.64

5 |24x38 1-9 No Bid $2.50
10-24 No Bid $2.50

25-40 No Bid $2.50

50+ No Bid $2.50

6 |24x 10 1-9 No Bid $3.12
10-24 $10.07 $3.12

25-40 $7.61 $3.12

50+ $7.61 $3.12

7 |24x 12 1-9 No Bid $3.76
10-24 $11.44 $3.76

25-40 $8.67 $3.76

50+ $8.67 $3.76

8 |18x18 1-9 No Bid $4.28
10-24 $11.52 $4.28

25-40 $8.69 $4.28

50+ $8.69 $4.28

9 |18x24 1-9 No Bid $5.64
10-24 $11.38 $5.64

25-40 $8.52 $5.64

50+ $8.52 $5.64

1024 x 24 1-9 No Bid $7.52
10-24 $16.39 $7.52

25-40 $12.15 $7.52

50+ $12.15 $7.52
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan

1124 x30 1-9 No Bid $9.40
10-24 $18.87 $9.40

25-40 $14.14 $9.40

50+ $14.14 $9.40

12|48 x 30 1-9 No Bid $18.80
10-24 $35.71 $18.80

25-40 $27.00 $18.80

50+ $27.00 $18.80

1330 x 30 1-9 No Bid $11.75
10-24 $22.37 $11.75

25-40 $16.90 $11.75

50+ $16.90 $11.75

14130 x 36 1-9 No Bid $14.10
10-24 $26.80 $14.10

25-40 $20.29 $14.10

50+ $20.29 $14.10

1548 x 24 1-9 No Bid $15.04
10-24 $28.60 $15.04

25-40 $21.64 $15.04

50+ $21.64 $15.04

16|36 x 36 1-9 No Bid $16.92
10-24 $33.33 $16.92

25-40 $24.77 $16.92

50+ $24.77 $16.92

1748 x 48 1-9 No Bid $30.08
10-24 $57.06 $30.08

25-40 $43.14 $30.08

50+ $43.14 $30.08

18]12x6 1-9 No Bid $0.94
10-24 No Bid $0.94

25-40 $3.57 $0.94

50+ $3.57 $0.94

19|24 x 6 1-9 No Bid $1.88
10-24 No Bid $1.88

25-40 $7.61 $1.88

50+ $7.61 $1.88
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan
20]36" circular 1-9 No Bid $16.92
10-24 $33.33 $16.92
25-40 $24.77 $16.92
50+ $24.77 $16.92
21]30" octagon 1-9 No Bid $11.75
10-24 $21.77 $11.75
25-40 $16.46 $11.75
50+ $16.46 $11.75
22]36" octagon 19 No Bid $16.92
10-24 $33.33 $16.92
25-40 $24.77 $16.92
50+ $24.77 $16.92
23 36" triangle 19 No Bid $16.92
10-24 $17.58 $16.92
25-40 $17.58 $16.92
50+ $17.58 $16.92
24 136" pentagon 19 No Bid $16.92
10-24 $33.33 $16.92
25-40 $24.77 $16.92
50+ $24.77 $16.92
Trail blazer & City entrance faces

25130 x 18 1-9 No Bid $12.63
10-24 No Bid $12.63
25-40 No Bid $12.63
50+ No Bid $12.63

F. |Traffic Faces FYG -- School
26|42x6 1-9 No Bid $5.89
10-24 No Bid $5.89
25-40 No Bid $5.89
50+ No Bid $5.89
27|24 x8 1-9 No Bid $4.48
10-24 No Bid $4.48
25-40 $9.88 $4.48
50+ $9.88 $4.48
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan
28|24 x 10 1-9 No Bid $5.59
10-24 No Bid $5.59
25-40 No Bid $5.59
50+ No Bid $5.59
29|24 x 12 1-9 No Bid $6.74
10-24 $18.44 $6.74
25-40 $14.41 $6.74
50+ $14.41 $6.74
30030x 18 1-9 No Bid $12.63
10-24 $32.25 $12.63
25-40 $24.88 $12.63
50+ $24.88 $12.63
31|48x24 1-9 No Bid $26.96
10-24 $76.08 $26.96
25-40 $59.46 $26.96
50+ $59.46 $26.96
32 36" Pentagon 19 No Bid $30.33
10-24 $75.13 $30.33
25-40 $58.23 $30.33
50+ $58.23 $30.33
33|60 x 48 1-9 No Bid $67.40
10-24 No Bid $67.40
25-40 No Bid $67.40
50+ No Bid $67.40
G.|Barricade Sheeting Rolls
Orange & White High Intensity Per Roll $160.95
1 8" x50 yd. Item # No Bid
Diamond grade pressure sensitive sheeting rolls 3M or
H.|equal
1 |White Per Roll Each No Bid $249.41
8" x 150’ Item #
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Group P - Street Marking Signs

Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan
I. |Decorative Poles
1 |16’ round black sign post No Bid No Bid
2 |Post top base round 3” OD No Bid No Bid
3 JPost base round 3” OD black $53.17 No Bid
4 |Round breakaway anchor v lock kit $81.29 No Bid
5 |SS bracket plus 4 for poles more than 4” OD $1.53 No Bid
6 Snap lock hose clamp assembly 38”’L/Post up to 12.25” OD $4.81 No Bid
Bracket ornate universal mount 30” / dogwood / lemon drop /
7 [black $85.03 No Bid
8 |Bare blank (Ridgeland) 30” bent lip $31.17 No Bid
9 |Post top finial 3 OD round #9516 Spear / Slipover / Black $52.60 No Bid
Sheeting for In-House Sign Printing *Must be Avery
J. |Dennison Brand*
1 |T1500 Sheeting — White 36” x 50 yds No Bid $436.50
2 [T1500 Sheeting — White 48” x 50 yds No Bid $582.00
3 [T6500 Sheeting — White 36” x 50 yds No Bid $612.00
4 [T6500 Sheeting — White 48” x 50 yds No Bid $816.00
5 [T7513 Sheeting — Yellow/Green 48” x 50 yds No Bid $1,590.00
6 |T7513 Sheeting — Yellow/Green 36” x 50 yds No Bid $1,192.50
7 [T6501 Sheeting — Yellow 48” x 50 yds No Bid $816.00
8 [T6501 Sheeting — Yellow 36” x 50 yds No Bid $612.00
9 [T6504 Sheeting — Orange 48” x 50 yds No Bid $816.00
10 [T6504 Sheeting — Orange 36” x 50 yds No Bid $612.00
11 [OL1000 Sheeting Anti-Graffiti 48” x 50 yds No Bid $990.00
12 |OL1000 Sheeting Anti-Graffiti 36” x 50 yds No Bid $742.50
Ink for In-House Sign Printing *Must be Avery
K. |Dennison Brand*
1 [Red Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 998018 No Bid $313.03
2 [Green Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 3998017AC No Bid $313.03
3 [Black Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 998012 No Bid $313.03
4 [Blue Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 998015AA No Bid $313.03
5 |Yellow Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 998011 No Bid $313.03
6 |Magenta Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 998018L No Bid $313.03
7 |Cyan Ink — 950 ML Bag Item No. 998015L No Bid $313.03
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Group P - Street Marking Signs
Contract Period 0-01-2023 through 12-31-2023
Renewable Option 01-01-2024 through 12-31-2024

CPC Vulcan
I. |Miscellaneous Materials for In-House Sign Printing
1 |Lint Free Swabs (25/Pack) Item No. 998333 No Bid $21.87
2 |Fluish (.5L) Item No. 9984040 No Bid $95.55
3 |Flush (950 ML Bag) Item No. 998010 No Bid $182.00
Heidi McGee J.Todd Koniar
PO Box 54091 PO Box 1850

Jackson, MS 39288
800-367-1492

heidi@cpcsigns.com

Foley, AL 36536
888-846-2745

vulcan1@vulcaninc.com
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