
Ferguson Waterworks                 Southern Waterworks

1 Standard 26" grate w/frame $534.00 $635.10
w/24" clearing opening w/city lettering
EJIW - V-5624

2 Standard 26" grate only w/city lettering $303.00 $360.27
EJIW - V-5624

3 $224.00 $266.78
w/22" clearing opening w/city lettering
EJIW - V-5724

4 Standard 24" grate only w/city lettering $135.00 $161.28
 EJIW -V- 5724-4
5 ADA Compliant 26" grate w/frame $533.00 $635.10

w/24" clear opening
EJIW - V-5624-80

6 ADA Compliant 26" grate only $347.00 $414.32
EJIW - V-5624-80

1 Standard 26" manhole frame w/cover $474.00 $564.82
w/4" Rise & 24" clear opening w/City Logo $474.00 $564.82
EJIW - 1046 (labeled SANITARY SEWER)
EJIW - 1046 (labeled STORM)

2 Standard 26" manhole frame w/cover $485.00 $582.85
w/7" Rise & 24" clear openign w/City Logo $485.00 $582.85
EJIW - 1045 (labeled SANITARY SEWER)
EJIW - 1045 (labeled STORM)

3 Standard 26" manhole cover only w/City Logo $225.00 $270.40
EJIW - 1040 (labeled SANITARY SEWER) $225.00 $270.40
EJIW - 1040 (labeled STORM)

II.  Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Manhole Frames & Covers

Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 01-01-23 through 12-31-23

Renewable Option 01-01-24 through 12-31-24

Standard 24" Grate w/Frame

I.  Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames



4 ERGO 1040hinged 26" manhole frame & cover $694.00 $818.50
w/4" Rise & 24" clear opening w/City Logo $694.00 $818.50
EJIW - 1040 (labeled SANITARY SEWER) $26.00 $24.52
EJIW - 1040 (labeled STORM)
EJIW 1013 Accessory "T" handle key tool

5 Reversible 26" manhole frame w/cover $395.00 $471.93
w/24" clear opening $395.00 $471.93
EJIW-V-1600-3(labeled SANITARY SEWER)
EJIW - V-1600-3 (labeled STORM)

6 Reversible 26" manhole cover only $210.00 $252.07
EJIW-V-1600-3(labeled SANITARY SEWER) $210.00 $252.07
EJIW-V-1600-3(labeled STORM)

7 23.5” X 1” Poly Manhole Riser Ring NO BID NO BID
8 23.5” X 1.5” Poly Manhole Riser Ring NO BID NO BID
9 23.5” X 2” Poly Manhole Riser Ring NO BID NO BID

10 26” X 1” Poly Manhole Riser Ring NO BID NO BID
11 26” X 1.5” Poly Manhole Riser Ring NO BID NO BID
12 26” X 2” Poly Manhole Riser Ring NO BID NO BID

1 1" Flat Round EJIW $73.00 $87.08
1" Tapered Round (.5 to 1") EJIW $70.00 $82.76

2 1 1/2" Flat Round EJIW $102.00 $125.88
1 1/2" Tapered Round (1.0" to 1 EJIW $84.00 $99.15

3 2" Flat Round EJIW $135.00 $161.22
2" Tapered round (1.0" to 2.0") EJIW $102.00 $125.86

1 18" - 24" height valve box price $180.00 $64.35
brand East Jordan SIP

p/n 85501922 6000
2 24" - 36" height valve box price $228.00 $85.80
  brand OR Sigma SIP

p/n 85502737 6005
3 1-1/2" valve box risers price $42.00 $27.75

brand Proselect OR SIP
p/n IVBR514J 6303

IV.  Ductile or Cast Iron Valve Boxes (w/out set screws)

III.  Infra-Riser Multi-Purpose Rubber Composite Adjustment Risers (24"ID X 36" OD)



4 1-1/4" valve box risers price No Bid $27.75
brand SIP

p/n 6303
5 2" valve box price $47.00 $27.75

brand East Jordan SIP
p/n IVBR514K 6303

1 2" price $47.00 $25.75
 brand Proselect  or EJ SIP

p/n IVBR514K 6303

1 Standard lid price $29.50 $13.73
 brand Proselect or EJ SIP
 p/n IVBR514L 6340/6341

1 Cleanout Ring EJIW - V-8503 $33.00 $40.39
 

2 Cleanout Cover EJIW - V-8503 $28.00 $32.92

3 Cleanout Ring & Cover EJIW - V8503 ASSY $62.00 $73.30

4 Concrete Pad for cleanout ring and cover $38.00 $20.00
  

1 Small w/lid price $78.67 NO BID
brand Sigma 

p/n SMB382

2 Large w/lid price $176.00 NO BID
brand Sigma 

p/n SMB381

V.  Ductile or Cast Iron Valve Box Risers

VI.  Ductile or cast iron valve box lids labeled with "Water" or "Sewer"

VII.  Ductile or Cast Iron Cleanout & Covered labeled "Sewer" and City of Gulfport Lettering



1 Small (19 1/8" X 9 3/4") price $25.33 NO BID
 brand Sigma
 p/n

2 Large - oval type price $53.90 NO BID
brand Sigma

p/n
3 Large - square type price $53.90 NO BID

 brand Sigma
p/n

Katje Toups Zack Guelker 

Winner indicated by this shading 14231 Seaway Rd #B5 429 Cole Road

Alternate indicated by this shading Gulfport, MS 39505 Hattiesburg, MS 
228-863-2757 601-268-7463
katje.toups@ferguson.com zack@southerwaterworks.com

IX.  Meter box lids only (metal)
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