Group S1 - Uniforms, Police Department
Contract Period 10-01-06 through 09-30-07

Renewable Option 10-01-07 through 09-30-08

Mid-South Atwork Roper Riverside Nafeco
Uniform & Uniforms Supply Co. Mfg. Co. Inc.
Supply, Inc.
Men’s long sleeve shirt Cat. 7920NP 910172 No Bid 1996 910172
Zipper front Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 30.33 27.00 $ 32.05 29.95
Men’s short sleeve shirt Cat. Z960NP 92017 No Bid 2996, 9201Z
Zipper front Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 27.39 26.00 $ 29.91 27.95
Women's long sleeve shirt Cat. Z905NP L9101Z No Bid 5656 L9101Z
Zipper front Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 30.33 27.00 $ 32.05 29.95
Women's short sleeve shirt Cat. X975NP 192017 No Bid 5756 1L9201Z
Zipper front Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 27.39 26.00 $ 29.91 27.95
Men’s trousers Cat. 909 9001 No Bid 6406 9001SP,
Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 28.49 35.95 $ 41.68 39.95
Women's trousers Cat. 1009 L9001 No Bid 5946 L9001SP
Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 28.49 35.95 $ 41.68 39.95
Heavy coat #3809ZS Cat. 3809ZS/T) 3,609.00 No Bid 34171 HS3322
with liner Brand Horace Small Southeastern Riverside Horace Small
Price 88.00 95.00 $ 139.05 99.00
Work trousers Cat. PTS0NV 3001 No Bid 6686 3001
Brand VF Imagewear Southeastern Riverside Southeastern
Price 12.95 25.95 $ 44.89 29.95
Squad shirts Cat. 20322 JK68] PROFS2013840S 2926 F545212001
Brand Topps Topps PROPPER Riverside PROPPER|
Price 33.50 38.00 25.55] $ 37.40 20.00
Squad pants Cat. 20320, Topps-DA60] PROFS2013840S 6696 F5200112001
Brand Topps Topps PROPPER Riverside PROPPER|
Price 36.88 44.00 25.55] $ 50.24 20.00
Summit Lifesaver Cat. 39314 315V No Bid 34358 39314
Outerwear Jacket Brand Elbeco Spiewak Riverside Elbeco
#39314 or equal Price 120.00 115.00 $ 139.05 115.00
Total 463.75 495.85 $ 617.91 479.65

Mid South Uniform & Supply, Inc.

1825 Terry Road
Jackson, MS 39204
800-325-3958 - phone
601-373-3616 - fax

accounting@midsouthuniform.com

1of 1



