GASOLINE and DIESEL FUEL SUPPLY CONTRACT - PRICE SHEET

Davison Fuels - Mike Mathews

Davison Leisure Portable
Eagle Energy Fuels Services | Fire Dept. | Police Dept.| Harbor DPW | Generators
Non-ethanol unleaded gas-87 Octane Taxes 0.16214 0.16214 0.162140| 0.162140] 0.162140] No Bid | 0.162140] No Bid
Mark-Up 0.05 ) 0.200000] 0.200000] 0.200000f No Bid | 0.150000] No Bid
Total 0.21214 0.35714 { 0.362140] 0.362140] 0.362140] No Bid | 0.312140] No Bid
Non-ethanol unleaded gas-90 Octane Taxes No bid 0.16214 E 0.162140] NoBid | NoBid | 0.400140] NoBid | NoBid
Mark-Up No bid 0.200000] No Bid No Bid | 0.350000] No Bid No Bid
Total No bid 0.35714 0.362140] No Bid No Bid | 0.750140] No Bid No Bid
Marine Grade Red Dye Diesel Taxes 0.00714 0.01714 No Bid No Bid No Bid | 0.064640] No Bid 0.064640
Mark-Up 0.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid | 0.350000] No Bid 0.500000
Total 0.05714 0.16214 No Bid No Bid No Bid | 0.414640] No Bid 0.564640
Diesel - On Road Taxes 0.13864 0.064640] 0.138640] 0.064640] 0.064640] 0.138640] No Bid
Mark-Up 0.05 0.200000] 0.200000f 0.200000} 0.350000f 0.100000f No Bid
Total 0.18864 0.264640] 0.338640] 0.264640| 0.414640] 0.238640] No Bid
Diesel - Off road Taxes 0.01714]  No bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
Mark-Up 0.05]  No bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid
Total 0.06714] No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | NoBid No Bid
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